2009-044

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
SARPY COUNTY, NEBRASKA
RESOLUTION DECLARING 1995 GMC PICKUP TRUCK WITH SNOWPLOW
SURPLUS PROPERTY

WHEREAS, pursuant to Neb. Rev. Stat. §23-104(6) (Reissue 1997), the County has the
power to do all acts in relation to the concerns of the County necessary to the exercise of its
corporate powers; and,

WHEREAS, pursuant to Neb. Rev. Stat. §23-103 (Reissue 1997), the powers of the County
as a body are exercised by the County Board; and,

WHEREAS, the 1995 GMC Pickup with snowplow, Unit# 108, VIN#
1GTGK24F7SZ563001, has been determined to be a total loss by the County and Progressive
Insurance.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Sarpy County Board of Commissioners
that aforementioned pickup with snowplow is hereby declared to be surplus property and authorizes
the Purchasing Department to dispose of the equipment in the best interest of Sarpy County;

DATED this 3rd day of March, 2009.

MOVED by Q\ ch " Vorosn . seconded by
R ns , that the above Resolution be adopted. Carried.
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Approved as to form;
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‘f)eputy County Attorney




Sarpy County Purchasing Department

Brian E. Hanson, Purchasing Agent
(402) 593-2349

SARPY COUNTY COURTHOUSE P i Purchasi n
Debb les, Assistant
121 " y Peop es( s?ls an 1ut‘c asing Agent
SUITE 1129

Beth Cunard, Purchaser/Contract Specialist
(402) 593-4476
Lois Spethman, Supply Clerk/Purchaser
(402) 593-2102

PAPILLION, NE 68046-2845
FAX (402) 593-4304

To:  Sarpy County Board of Commissioners

From: Lois Spethman

Re:  Resolution Declaring 1995 GMC Pickup Truck With Snowplow Surplus Property
The Highway Department is requesting that 1995 GMC Pickup with snowplow be declared

surplus property. Per Sarpy County Resolution “Approving Vehicle Acquisition & Disbursement
Policy”, January 13, 1998, attached is Fleet Services” recommendation for disposal of the pickup.

Progressive Insurance has declared the Highway Department’s 1995 GMC Pickup with
snowplow, Unit # 108, VIN # 1GTGK24F7SZ56300, a total loss. Pat Clarke, Fleet Service and
Progressive Insurance has agreed on a settlement of $5,100.00 for the GMC pickup and
$2,000.00 for the snowplow.

Fleet Service will remove the radio and auxiliary fuel tank. After this is done, Progressive will
take the vehicle for salvage. The title will be held until the settlement check is received.

It is recommended that the attached title and the Resolution, declaring the Highway Department
GMC pickup with snowplow surplus property, be signed.

If you have any questions, please feel free to call me at 593-2102.

February 26, 2009

LAS

Attachments

cc: Mark Wayne
Deb Houghtaling
Brian Hanson
Rich Weber

Pat Clarke




SARPY COUNTY
FLEET SERVICE DEPARTMENT

15100 SOUTH 84™ STREET FLEET MANAGER
PAPILLION, NF 68046 Patrick Clarke
Phone 402-339-9985 pclarke@sarpy com

FAX 402-339-7625
Memo

To: Sarpy County Board of Commissioners
From: Patrick Clarke

Re: Declare Highway Department Vehicle Total Loss

On February 13, 2009 a Highway Department vehicle — 1995 GMC 2500 pickup truck
with snowplow VIN: 1GTGK24F7S2563001 with 122,821 miles — was involved in an
accident. The county vehicle was declared a total loss. It was determined that the other
party involved was at fault. They offered payment for the county’s loss in the amount
$7100.00.

| recommend that we accept this offer and approve a resolution declaring the vehicle a
total loss. The title will need to be signed off and Fleet Service will forward the {itle to the

salvage company after we receive payment.

Any question please let me know

3
February 27, 2009 | Fel  UHigde

Patrick Clarke
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Chris Vance

From: Pat Clarke

Sent:  Friday, February 20, 2009 9:32 AM

To: Lori Sysel; Linda Swanson; Brian Hanson; Rich Weber; Dannielle McKulsky
Cc: ‘Eiden, Pete'; Renee Lansman; Chris Vance

Subject: RE: Driver's Motor Vehicle Accident Report - Truck #108 - 1995 GMC

| spoke with Heidi Judson of Progressive Insurance about the loss of Highway Truck # 108 -1995 GMC Pickup —~
VIN 1GTGK24F7SZ563001. They are agreeing with my assessment that this truck is a total loss and
have offered a settlement of $5,100 for the pickup truck and $2,000 for the snow plow. I agreed to this
amount. They are going take the pickup truck next Wednesday 25 Feb 2009 for salvage. We will be
removing the radio and auxiliary fuel tank.

Can we have the vehicle declared a loss and the title signed at the next County Board meeting? I would
recommend that we hold the title until we receive the settlement check.

Any question please let me know.
Patrick Clarke
Fleet Service Manager

From: Eiden, Pete [mailto:Pete@nirma.info}

Sent: Wednesday, February 18, 2009 2:32 PM

To: Pat Clarke; Lori Sysel

Subject: RE: Driver's Motor Vehicle Accident Report

Either way this unit does not have any Physical Damage coverage so hopefully the adverse drivers carrier will
step up to the plate and offer to pay the County damages.

Pete

Peter E. Eiden, AIC

NIRMA - Claims Manager

CenterStone Building

100 North 12th Street, Suite 200 (68508)
PO Box 85210

Lincoln, NE 68501-5210

T: 402-742-9220

F: 402-742-9230

Email: pete@nirma.info

From: Pat Clarke [mailto: pclarke@sarpy.com]
Sent: Wednesday, February 18, 2009 7:51 AM

To: Lori Sysel

Cc: Eiden, Pete

Subject: RE: Driver's Motor Vehicle Accident Report

| check the VIN number on the vehicle and it matches the title. They must have misread the VIN and switch a Z or

a 2. ltwas a little hard to read the VIN number directly off the vehicle at the accident site. See Attached Pictures.
Patrick Clarke

3/4/2009
OEGOGEGEGEGEEEEESSSSSSS——


mailto:Pet@nirma.info
mailto:pclarke@sarpy.com
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Fleet Service Manager

From: Lori Sysel
Sent: Tuesday, February 17, 2009 4:37 PM
To: 'Eiden, Pete'; Jeff Davis; Rolly Yost; Pat Clarke; Linda Swanson; Brian Hanson; Rich Weber; Sam Downey;
Daniel Golda; Judy Shook
Cc: Renee Lansman; Chris Vance
Subject: Driver's Motor Vehicle Accident Report
Mr. Eiden:
Please find attached the Driver's Motor Vehicle Accident Report for an accident on February 13,
2009 involving Sarpy County Employee Jason Burbee and a 1995 GMC 2500 Pickup, VIN #
1GTGK24F7SZ563001.
Please note that the above VIN number does not match that of the VIN number listed in the attached
document or the VIN number reported in a document sent to you earlier today. I have attached the title
for this vehicle for VIN number verification.
Thank you,
Lori Sysel
Administrative Assistant
402-593-4471
Sarpy County Clerk
1210 Golden Gate Drive
Papillion, NE 68046

WWWw.sarpy.com

Please confirm receipt by replying to this email

Click here to report this email as spam.

This message has been scanned for malware by SurfControl plc. www.surfcontrol.com

3/4/2009
GGG


http://www.sarpy.com
http://www.surfcontrol.com
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Chris Vance

From: Chris Vance

Sent:  Wednesday, March 04, 2009 11:31 AM
To: Linda Swanson

Cc: Lori Sysel

Subject: RE: TITLE FOR 1995 PICKUP

It is ready to go. Bring me a copy of the envelope or I'll make one when you are here. See you
shortly!

Thanks;
Chwis Ve

Please confirm receipt by replying to this email.

Chris Vance, Senior Administrator
Sarpy County Clerk’s Board Administration office, 1210 Golden Gate Dr., Papillion, NE 68046
(402) 593-4155
WWw.sarpy.com

From: Linda Swanson

Sent: Wednesday, March 04, 2009 11:29 AM
To: Lori Sysel

Cc: Chris Vance

Subject: TITLE FOR 1995 PICKUP

Lori,

Did you get the title signed off by the County Board yesterday for the 1995 Chevy (GMC) Pickup that was
salvaged?

Is it available to pickup as | have a postage paid envelope for it to be sent to?
Thanks!!!

Linda Swanson

Sarpy County Fleet Services
Iswanson@sarpy.com
(402)339-9985

3/4/2009
GGG
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PROGRESSIVE CLAIMS g
G PROGRESSIVE

OMAHA, NE 68154-3950

Underwritten By:

Progressive Northern Insurance

Company
Claim Number:  09-5905599

Loss Date: February 13, 2009
SARPY COUNTY FLEET SERVICES Document Date; February 26, 2009

15100 S 84TH STREET Page 1 of 1
PAPILLION, NE 68046

claims.progressive.com

Track the status and details of your daim,
e-mail your representative or report a

new claim.

Claim Information

This letter is in follow up to our conversation with Pat on February 26, 2009.
During this conversation we confirmed that the Insurance Auto Auction was in route to pick up the salvaged 1995
K2500.

GMC

Enclosed is the draft for the agreed total loss settlement amount, $7,100.00. Please send us the properly endorsed title in

the enclosed postage paid envelope.

HEIDi JUDSON

Claims Department

1-402-498-7421

1-800-PROGRESSIVE (1-800-776-4737)
Fax: 1-402-498-7445

" Form Z587 XX (01/08) - NE

BUSINESS REPLY MAIL

FIRST-CLASS MAIL  PERMIT NO 5107  CLEVELAND OH

POSTAGE WILL BE PAID BY ADDRESSEE

PROGRESSIVE

10909 MILL VALLEY RD STE 220
OMAHA NE 68154-9608

NO POSTAGE
NECESSARY
IF MAILED
IN THE
UNITED STATES



http://claims.progressive.com

